
2025 Member Virtual Exhibition 
Accepted Entries

Michelle Akimenko 
Winged Sanctuary 
Composition of random 
weave baskets 

Sara Alfaro 
Rough Shell, Radiant Core 
Painting 

Sara Alfaro 
3 Muses 
Impasto, palette knife 
application acrylic on 
canvas 

Gonzalo Battaglia 
Amelia's Starling 
Photography 

Gonzalo Battaglia 
In My Arm 
Silver point 

April Beckenhauer Pino 
Obstacle Race Ice Baptism 
Marker, colored pencil, gel 
pen 

April Beckenhauer Pino 
Obstacle Race Mud 
Baptism 
Graphite 

Christie Becker-Fitzgerald 
Baiting Hallow 
Marker, acrylic paint, 
watercolor paint, color 
pencils, rocks 

Jerilyn Brown 
Full Plate 
Transparent watercolor 
on 140 lb Arches hot press 
watercolor paper 

Jerilyn Brown 
Out on a Limb 2 
Transparent watercolor 
on 140 lb Arches hot press 
watercolor paper 

Aleta Burge 
Le Petit Soleil 
Carved, penetrated 
stoneware hemisphere 
lined with brass mesh and 
illuminated by fairy lights 
inside shining from carved 
openings, metallic glazed, 
fired in oxidation 

Aleta Burge 
Emergence 
High fired stoneware 
vessel with glazes and 
oxides 

Patricia Cummins 
Bashakill Wetlands 
Pastel on Paper 

Patricia Cummins 
Minnewaska Memories 
Pastel on paper 

Patricia Cummins 
Bashakill Fall 
Pastel on pastel board 

Patricia Cummins 
Adirondack Retreat 
Gouache on watercolor 
Paper 

Patricia Cummins 
Stone Arch Bridge 
oil on canvas 

Alison Curtis 
Hero 
Mixed media 

Alison Curtis 
Twiggy 
Mixed media oil painting 
with original magazine 
clippings from Good 
Housekeeping magazines 
from the 1960's 

Lauren D'Apuzzo 
Digital Weaving 
Interactive generative 
digital art weaving 
simulation 

Lauren D'Apuzzo 
En-lightened 
Light, Fresnel lenses, and 
fishing line 

Barbara Davis 
Collecting 
Cone 5 porcelain, wheel 
thrown, sgrafitto, Cone 5 
glaze, low fire lusters 
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Erika DiGirolamo 
Old Homosassa 
Collage, paint, string, 
iridescent glass beads, 
crayons 
 
Erika DiGirolamo 
Protect Our Waters 
Recycled Florida travel 
guides, maps, and paper 
crafted from Citrus County 
Chronicles 
 
Erika DiGirolamo 
Inverness Art Festival 
Collage, watercolor, 
Prismacolor, pencil 
shavings 
 
Erika DiGirolamo 
Rainbow River 
Collage, paint, string, 
iridescent glass beads, 
crayons 
 
Erika DiGirolamo 
Devil's Den 
Collage, paint, string, 
iridescent glass beads, 
crayons 
 
Jennifer Douglas 
Firecracker 
Watercolor on paper 
 
Jennifer Douglas 
Grief Draw: Ruby 2025 
Charcoal on paper 
 
 
 

Rosemary Fineberg 
"October9th" 
Acrylic on recycled canvas 
 
Rosemary Fineberg 
"Pesach 2024" 
Acrylic on canvas 
 
Paula Gale 
Bounty of the Shoreline 
Sculpted bronze leaf, 
amethyst and aventurine 
beads, bronze chain 
 
Paula Gale 
Guardian of the Reef 
Silver metal clay 
 
Paula Gale 
The Sea Remembered 
Bronze metal clay, silver 
metal clay, fossilized coral 
beads 
 
Madelaine Gonzalez 
Doubled Silhouette Selfie 
Digital photograph 
 
Madelaine Gonzalez 
Maine self portrait in 
Tintype 
Digital photograph 
 
Salvatore James Gulino 
Night Watch 
Altered mannequin torso, 
porch light fixture, French 
horn, sword, metal eagle's 
wing, steel disc, hand-
sculpted cloud, hand-
sculpture female figure 
 

Donna Haynes 
“Danseuse Serpentine” 
Wood, plexi, found 
newspaper, pen, paper, 
thread, thread spools, 
found doll head 
 
Donna Haynes 
"The Georgiannas" 
Lace fringe, rust print, 
photo transfer, bobbin 
lace, paper casting, found 
buttons, found pins, and 
feather 
 
Latonya Hicks 
Lunchbox Promises on the 
Long Ride 
Yarn, Pez dispensers, acrylic 
paint, ribbon, letters, hot 
wheels, vintage lunchboxes, 
smurf thermos, pink panther 
and Romper Room record, 
grandma’s blanket, 
Chipmunk’s ABC book, 
notebook paper, string 
 
Latonya Hicks 
Fighting Amongst Friends: 
Who Invited Old Tom 
Yarn, cord, roving, beads, 
acrylic paint, Glass, resin, 
drawers, brooms, nobs, 
needle work, jean shelf, 
romance novels, vintage 
wooden jewelry box, hand 
me down dolls, Old Tom's 
Roost sign, wooden finials, 
vintage cowboys and 
Indians, drawer pulls, 
handmade dolls, fabric, 
glitter, figurines 
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Amanda Holloway 
That They May Take Hold 
Photographic film, color, 
scanned, enlarged, 
reprinted digitally 
 
Amanda Holloway 
Poverty nor Riches, only 
Daily Bread 
Photographic film, color, 
scanned, enlarged, 
reprinted digitally 
 
Amanda Holloway 
Swim Team Comradery 
Photographic film, black 
and white silver gelatin 
print 
 
Cassia Kite 
The Lightning Ranger 
Revival 
Acrylic, graphite and 
colored pencil on canvas 
 
Robin Lemo 
Memories Of A Past Life 
Acrylic painting 
 
Robin Lemo 
Missing 
Acrylic painting 
 
Robin Lemo 
Bluebird 
Acrylic painting 
 
Jacquelene Lieberman 
Identity Crisis 
Plaster, plexiglass, acrylic 
paint, wood 

Jacquelene Lieberman 
The Devil within 
Ceramic 
 
Shelby Maddox 
The Imprint Series (2) 
Cut leaves, acrylic ink on 
polypropylene paper 
 
Cindy Oakes 
Flow 
Acrylic paint 
 
Cindy Oakes 
Pretty in Pink 
Digital photography 
 
Cindy Oakes 
Garden Party 
Digital photography 
 
Cindy Oakes 
Good vs. Evil; Which Will 
Prevail? 
Digital art/ photography 
 
Gerald Obregon 
Has This Ever Happened 
To You? 
Oil 
 
Sheryl Odza 
Reflection 
Clay printmaking on Pellon 
 
Sheryl Odza 
Eyes 
Clay printmaking on 
Pellon, tempera paint, 
Kaolin, chalk 
 
 

Sheryl Odza 
Orange Prisms 
Clay printmaking on Pellon 
 
Kristin Osterman 
Sundays With Nona 
Oil pastel 
 
Kristin Osterman 
Soulful Radiance 
Oil Pastel 
 
Kristin Osterman 
Grace In Bloom 
Pastel 
 
Lindsay Pharo 
Gloria 
Multiple thrown pieces on 
the wheel combined 
together and then altered 
 
Lindsay Pharo 
Wrapped in a Glow 
Pottery and sculpture 
 
Lindsay Pharo 
Wood fired Organic Vase 
Pottery and sculpture 
wood fired Cone 10 
 
Lindsay Pharo 
Oscar Under The Sea 
Pottery and sculpture 
midfire clay 
 
Catherine Rivera 
"From My Garden" 
Bracelet, silver, Chinese 
Porcelain Shard, glass 
beads, fireline 
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Catherine Rivera 
"She Emerged From the 
Sacred Conch" (Awakening 
from Ignorance) 
Pendant, silver, carved 
agate, carved boxwood, 
pearls, glass beads, silk, 
brass, gold filled toggle 
 
Catherine Rivera 
"Reconciliation" (Restoring 
Harmony) 
Bracelet, fused glass, glass 
beads, silver, silver beads, 
pearls, fireline 
 
Catherine Rivera 
"That Which is Left 
Behind" 
Pendant, silver, crazy lace 
agate, glass and silver 
beads, silver toggle 
 
Christopher Roll 
In the Studio 
Oil on canvas based on 
original digital 
photography 
 
Christopher Roll 
In the Studio II 
Oil on canvas inspired by 
original digital 
photography 
 
Christopher Roll 
The Flirtation 
Oil on canvas from original 
photograph 
 
 

Kathy Schmidt 
Daughter 
Fiber art; appliqué, 
embroidery, hand quilting 
assorted cotton fabrics, 
cotton and metallic 
threads 
 
Dwayne Shepherd 
Burst of Color 
Acrylic painting 
 
Dwayne Shepherd 
Orchid in Bloom 
Oil painting 
 
Julie TerHaar 
Perplexed 
Oil and liquin 
 
Julie TerHaar 
Serene 
Oil and liquin on canvas 
 
Julie TerHaar 
Lake Hollingsworth 
oil and liquin 
 
Julie TerHaar 
Free 
Oil and liquin on wood 
 
Kathleen Tracey 
Three Fish 
Alcohol marker 
 
Kathleen Tracey 
The Siren 
Mixed media on a vintage 
jean jacket 
 
 

Grace Villalobos 
Tamale/Chinese Lantern 
Oil on wood and ceramic 
on small wooden shelf 
 
Grace Villalobos 
Sombrero Pintado/Plastic 
Folded Bag 
Oil on wood and ceramic 
on small wooden shelf 
 
Grace Villalobos 
Blusa/Comal 
Oil on wood and ceramic 
on small wooden shelf 
 
Grace Villalobos 
Yangban/Peineta 
Oil on wood and ceramic 
on small wooden shelf 
 
Grace Villalobos 
Jade Bracelet/Carreta 
Oil on wood and ceramic 
on small wooden shelf 
 
Gabrielle Weir 
Fiber Foliate 
Freehand and machine-
stitched leaves, African 
fabrics, canvas 
 
 
 




